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Thermo Fisher Scientific Adds EM2 Solutions to its Global Partner Alliance, Strengthening 
Company’s Informatics Offerings for Environmental Laboratories 

 
PHILADELPHIA (October 6, 2010) – Thermo Fisher Scientific Inc., the world leader in serving 
science, today announced that it has extended its relationship with EM2 Solutions to more 
comprehensively serve the needs of environmental testing organizations. EM2 Solutions has 
been a member of the Thermo Scientific Global Partner Alliance since 2009, initially acting in the 
primary role of consultant leveraging their strong quality management and informatics systems 
background. EM2 has recently been working with Thermo Scientific Informatics strategic 
development teams to define a new solution for water, wastewater and environmental testing labs 
based on the company’s flagship Laboratory Information Management System (LIMS), 
SampleManager, the industry standard LIMS solution for commercial and public sector testing 
labs. As National Environmental Laboratory Accreditation Council (NELAC) auditors, EM2 
consultants have evaluated numerous labs and lab systems solutions and used that industry 
knowledge and skill set to define a series of SampleManager configurations that now deliver an 
off-the-shelf, lab-ready environmental testing product.  
 
EM2 will also provide services and support for the full range of Thermo Scientific Informatics 
solutions that serve the environmental testing industry, which include quality systems 
implementation, audit services, laboratory data management, as well as NELAC and industry 
regulatory requirement support. With extensive experience and expertise in delivering solutions to 
analytical laboratories/chemists, EM2’s partnership with Thermo Fisher Scientific will also inform 
and support the product development process so that Thermo Scientific Informatics solutions to 
these industries will be in line with specific regulatory and business challenges.   
 
EM2 Chief Executive Officer Jeanne Mensingh will deliver a presentation at the upcoming Gulf 
Coast Conference, October 12-13 in Galveston, Texas. Mensingh, who has extensive experience 
in quality management and process improvement in laboratory, quality and regulated 
environments, will deliver “Meeting Water and Environmental Regulatory Requirements with a 
LIMS Solution.” This presentation will review how Thermo Fisher Scientific and EM2 Solutions 
have partnered to formulate a Water and Environmental LIMS Solution based on Thermo 
Scientific SampleManager LIMS 10.0 which meets ISO 17025/NELAC requirements, is capable 
of seamless integration with other software and is expandable for future growth. This presentation 
will show how the Thermo Scientific Water and Environmental Solution meets key  ISO 
17025/NELAC requirements related to sample tracking, traceability, statement of work (SOW) 
and contract review (quotes and invoicing), preparation and analytical batches, instrument 
integration and reporting.  
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"EM2 Solutions’ customers will benefit from this new partnership with the development, service 
and sales teams at Thermo Fisher Scientific. By offering Thermo Scientific Informatics software 
specifically designed for the environmental testing industry, we are able to provide our customers 
with a comprehensive solution for managing their data and laboratory workflow which meets the 
demands of the business environment and complies with increasing regulatory requirements,” 
said Jeanne A. Mensingh, Principal Consultant and Chief Executive Officer at EM2. 
 
“Thermo Fisher’s Global Partner Alliance Program brings together the expertise of sales and 
services organizations around the world, allowing Thermo Scientific Informatics solutions to be 
delivered to private and public sector businesses across the broadest range of industries. EM2 
offers expertise in analytical sciences process optimization, specifically in the environmental 
testing arena, integrating many normally stand-alone solutions in a single workflow and helping 
smaller to medium sized companies maintain the same quality processes as the largest 
companies can achieve. Our partnership with EM2 enhances our understanding of the needs of 
analytical labs so that development of our solutions is tailored to their requirements. Our 
informatics solutions for the water industry will enable EM2 to further build on their history of 
success in that market,” said Dave Champagne, vice president and general manager for Thermo 
Fisher Scientific’s Informatics business.     
 
For more information about Thermo Scientific Informatics solutions, please call +1866-463-6522 
(US), +44 161 942 3000 (Intl), e-mail marketing.informatics@thermofisher.com or visit 
www.thermoscientific.com/informatics.   
 
Thermo Scientific is part of Thermo Fisher Scientific, the world leader in serving science. 
 
About Thermo Fisher Scientific 
Thermo Fisher Scientific Inc. (NYSE: TMO) is the world leader in serving science. Our mission is 
to enable our customers to make the world healthier, cleaner and safer. With revenues of more 
than $10 billion, we have approximately 35,000 employees and serve customers within 
pharmaceutical and biotech companies, hospitals and clinical diagnostic labs, universities, 
research institutions and government agencies, as well as in environmental and process control 
industries. We create value for our key stakeholders through two premier brands, Thermo 
Scientific and Fisher Scientific, which offer a unique combination of continuous technology 
development and the most convenient purchasing options. Our products and services help 
accelerate the pace of scientific discovery, and solve analytical challenges ranging from complex 
research to routine testing to field applications. Visit www.thermofisher.com 
 
About EM2 Solutions 
EM2 Solutions is a quality assurance/quality control solutions company based in Houston, TX.  
Our primary focus is to provide tailored QA and laboratory informatics support to small and 
medium sized businesses to help them meet the same quality and regulatory requirements as 
large companies.  We execute quality management systems based on ISO Standards, NELAC, 
regulatory requirements, and best practices within numerous industry sectors.  EM2 is dedicated 
to providing tailored solutions for customer specific problems.  Our services include audits, 
technical/procedure writing, validation, training, and process improvements.  In addition, EM2 
provides software project management and administration support to laboratories for LIMS and 
document management system integrations. 
 
For further press information please contact: Sarah Evans, The Scott Partnership, 1 Whiteside, 
Station Road, Holmes Chapel, Cheshire, CW4 8AA, United Kingdom, Tel: + 44 1477 539 539, 
Fax: +44 1477 539 540 E-mail: thermofisher@scottpr.com 
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